
$7500.00 / Monthly - 117 SUNSET Boulevard
 

Listing ID: 40297014

$7500.00 / Monthly
4 Bedrooms, 3 Bathrooms, 0.41 acres
Single Family

117 SUNSET Boulevard, The Blue
Mountains, Ontario, N0H2P0

MONTHLY RENTAL AVAILABLE -
Gorgeous waterfront location with fabulous
views of the sunsets and Georgian Bay!
Located between Thornbury and Meaford
and a short drive to Georgian Peaks,
Craigleith, Alpine and Blue Mountain
Resort. Lots of space in this fantastic fully
furnished open concept home with wood
burning fireplace, updated kitchen with
granite countertops, large island and
stainless steel appliances. Perfect space for
entertaining family and friends. Spacious
main floor primary bedroom with ensuite.
Three other bedrooms with 4 piece
bathroom on the second level. This property
comfortably entertains and sleeps 9. Snow
removal included. No Smokers. No pets.
Damage/Utility deposit required. Book your
showing today! (id:37775)
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