
$5000.00 / Monthly - 130 STEAMSHIP BAY Road Unit# 602
 

Listing ID: 40346903

$5000.00 / Monthly
2 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 1800
Single Family

130 STEAMSHIP BAY Road Unit# 602,
Gravenhurst, Ontario, P1P1Z9

Welcome to The Greavette at Steamship
Bay Road at the Muskoka Wharf in
Gravenhurst. Offering stunning views of
Muskoka Bay from the gorgeous 2
bedroom/2 bath Pent House suite featuring
nine-foot plus ceilings, 2 gas fireplaces,
stainless appliances, 2 expansive balconies
with gas BBQ and laundry. Easy Access To
Lake Muskoka For boating, swimming,
paddling or just lounging. Maintenance free
living and a Muskoka Life Style is perfect
for year round or vacationing. This spacious
unit is set for entertaining both small and
large groups with an open concept interior
including a Gourmet kitchen, upscale
finishing's including: granite, hardwood,
ceramic, Large master wing with two huge
walk-in closets and 5 pc. ensuite with walk
in shower unit. Large 2nd bedroom with 2 X
Double beds with double closet. Great
views and walking distance to all the
activities, restaurants and shops at Muskoka
Wharf. Rental unit is beautifully furnished
and includes a covered parking spot and
storage unit. Long term tenants preferred
but there is some flexibility. Don't miss this
amazing rental opportunity! Call for more
information about leasing options and set up
a personal viewing! (id:37775)
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