
$20000.00 / Seasonal - 599460 2ND Concession N
 

Listing ID: 40351510

$20000.00 / Seasonal
3 Bedrooms, 3 Bathrooms, 34 acres
Single Family

599460 2ND Concession N, Meaford
(Municipality), Ontario, N0H1B0

WINTER SEASONAL RENTAL. Kick
back and relax this Winter in a 3 bedroom
+den, stylish and peaceful space while
enjoying the beautiful panoramic views of
the countryside and Georgian Bay! Located
just 2.5 hours from Toronto and only 15
minutes from the quaint town of Meaford
there is no shortage of amazing places to
explore including the Coffin Ridge winery
located just a few meters up the road.
Features: A Cozy toasty two-sided gas
fireplace between the kitchen and living
room - beautiful dining room to entertain
your guests - Fully stocked kitchen with
stainless steel appliances - Master en-suite
overlooking Georgian Bay - At home office
with high-speed internet and 34 acres with
trails to explore. (id:37775)
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